
Henry G.
Haberl,74

Marian — Henry Gerhart
Haberl, son of Martin and
Margaret Bauer Haberl, was born
on a farm near Templeton, on
April 1, 1904. He was baptized &
confirmed at the Sacred Heart
church in Templeton. He attended
country school and grew to
adulthood on his parent's farm.
He then worked on farms for
several years.

On Sept. 5, 1933, he married
Rose Dozler in Granite Falls,
Minn. Three children were born to
this union. After their marriage,
they farmed south of Manning
until 1942 when they moved to a
farm near Manilla. They retired
from farming in 1971 and moved
to Harlan. This has been their
home sincethattime.

Mr Haberl died at Myrtue
Memorial hospital in Harlan on
Thursday, March 29, 1979, at age
74 years, 11 months and 28 days.
He had been a member of St.
Michael's church in Harlan.

In addition to his parents, he
was preceded in death by a
brother, John and by a sister,
Josephine. Survivors include his
wife, Rose, of Harlan; a son. Gene
Haberl of Los Angeles, Calif.; two
daughters - Imogene (Mrs
Francis McGovern) and Inez Ann
Haberl, both of Omaha; and five
grandchildren, by four brothers -
Frank and Joe, both of Coon
Rapids, Charles of Clarinda and
Ben of Carroll; a sister, Marie
Knobbe of Carroll; nieces and
nephews and other relatives.

A Mass of Christian Burial
was celebrated at St. Michael's
church in Harlan on Saturday,
March 31, 1979, with Rev. Richard
G. Wagner as celebrant. Burial
was in the Harlan cemetery, with
Lee Ehlers, Floyd Jensen, George
Dozler, Lenus Haberl, Edwin
Haberl and Erwin Haberl serving
as pallbearers.

Pauley Funeral Home was in
charge of the services.


